
€ 4,500,000
Ref: HM1535V

Villa for sale in Casares, Costa del Sol
5 Bedrooms | 5 Bathrooms | 655 m² Interior | 81 m² Terraces | Garage Yes | Jardín Yes | Piscina Yes

Property Description

Nestled within a prestigious resort, this complex offers privileged access to an array of 5-star
amenities, including a lavish spa and clubhouse boasting top-tier facilities. Enhanced by 24-hour
security, this exceptional property promises a lifestyle of unparalleled luxury and tranquility,
epitomizing the essence of Andalusian living at its most refined. This golf development is located in
a prestigious Urbanization, considered the best Golf Resort in Europe. A benchmark in urban
development and one of the best gated communities in southern Europe. The world-famous Marina
of Puerto Banus is only 30 minutes drive or the select Marina of Sotogrande can be reached in 10
minutes.Nestled within the enclave of Finca Cortesin resort, this villa exudes the charm of Ibiza-
style residences. The white structure, adorned with traditional Mediterranean stones, creates a
captivating atmosphere for ultimate enjoyment. Set on a generous plot, the property boasts
meticulously manicured gardens, adorned with swaying palm trees and vibrant floral bushes. A
stunning pool beckons for a refreshing dip, while the covered terrace provides a delightful space for
al-fresco dining and a relaxing oasis.The inviting ground floor encompasses a spacious living, dining
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and kitchen area, adorned with high ceilings and abundant windows that bathe the space in natural
light. The modern kitchen comes fully equipped with top-of-the-line Gaggenau appliances. Two
guest rooms, with direct access to the garden, are thoughtfully located on the ground floor. The
upper level of the villa is dedicated to the remaining bedrooms, each boasting its own private
bathroom. The property boasts sweeping views of the golf course and surrounding mountain range,
providing an idyllic backdrop that radiates tranquility and serenity. The property also has a private
driveway for parking convenience within the plot.
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